
Some clips may be behind a paywall.  If Regional employees need access to these clips, please contact 
your Regional Communications Manager (NWRO – Tom Decker; NCRO – Megan Lehman; NERO – Patti 
Monahan; SERO – Robyn Briggs; SCRO – John Repetz; SWRO – Laina Aquiline). If Central Office staff (and 
others outside of DEP) need access to these clips, please email me at brandongla@pa.gov 
 
 
Top DEP Stories 
 
Daily American: DEP discusses permit process for Rockwood Quarry; listen to concerns of project's 
impact 
https://www.dailyamerican.com/story/news/local/2025/07/01/rockwood-quarry-concerns-voiced-at-
dep-meeting-somerset-county-pa/84408858007/ 
 
WITF: Pa.’s SPEED program lets developers skip line for environmental review of some construction 
permits 
https://www.witf.org/2025/06/30/pa-s-speed-program-lets-developers-skip-line-for-environmental-
review-of-some-construction-permits/ 
 
 
Mentions 
 
WTAE: Debris in creek causing concerns for North Versailles property owners in wake of flooding 
https://www.wtae.com/article/debris-in-creek-concerns-north-versailles-property-owners-
flooding/65118989 
 
Tribune-Review: Donegal area mine expansion challenged; opponent says it will harm environment 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/donegal-area-mine-expansion-challenged-opponent-says-it-
will-harm-environment/ 
 
Lebtown.com: Mosquito control program surveilling standing, stagnant water for larvae 
https://lebtown.com/2025/07/01/mosquito-control-program-surveilling-standing-stagnant-water-for-
larvae/ 
 
Bradford Era: Mosquito spraying today in McKean Co. 
https://www.bradfordera.com/2025/07/01/mosquito-spraying-today-mckean-co/ 
 
Pa Environment Digest Blog: Environmental Hearing Board Denies Request To End Appeal Of Catalyst 
Energy, Inc. Oil & Gas Wastewater Injection Well Permit In McKean County 
https://paenvironmentdaily.blogspot.com/2025/06/environmental-hearing-board-denies.html 
 
Shamokin News-Item: SCRA projects lay groundwork for a cleaner, healthier Shamokin Creek 
https://www.newsitem.com/news/local/scra-projects-lay-groundwork-for-a-cleaner-healthier-
shamokin-creek/article_927832e8-ee76-4939-a4f7-4b6f53c957ef.html  
 
DuBois Courier-Express: Public works official: Anderson Creek dam repair costs could top $500K 
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/public-works-official-anderson-creek-dam-repair-costs-
could-top-500k/article_2b0b94d4-4334-42cc-b13d-e3ac2a96d64c.html  
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Marcellus Shale News: Disappointing: PA Senate Confirms Jessica Shirley as DEP Secretary 
https://marcellusdrilling.com/2025/06/disappointing-pa-senate-confirms-jessica-shirley-as-dep-
secretary/  
 
 
Air 
 
PublicSource: Allegheny County loses millions in green infrastructure grants as feds cut funding, ease 
regulations 
https://www.publicsource.org/allegheny-county-environmental-funding-cuts-epa-deregulation/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Letter to the editor: Air pollution and dementia 
https://triblive.com/opinion/letter-to-the-editor-air-pollution-and-dementia/ 
 
 
Climate Change 
 
York Dispatch: Extreme heat an example of things to come 
https://www.yorkdispatch.com/story/opinion/contributors/2025/06/26/extreme-heat-an-example-of-
things-to-come/84367916007/ 
 
 
Conservation and Recreation 
 
Lebtown.com: Three more Lebanon County farms preserved for ‘forever and a day’ 
https://lebtown.com/2025/07/01/three-more-lebanon-county-farms-preserved-for-forever-and-a-day/ 
 
Meadville Tribune: 'Threat to future generations': Conservation efforts facing $754 million in proposed 
federal budget cuts 
https://www.meadvilletribune.com/news/threat-to-future-generations-conservation-efforts-facing-754-
million-in-proposed-federal-budget-cuts/article_d0be066f-a9ce-59c9-a7e5-390002ac4752.html 
 
WICU-TV: North East Marina Transfer Authority Signs Agreement of Sale for Transfer of the North East 
Marina 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/52890304/north-east-marina-transfer-authority-signs-
agreement-of-sale-for-transfer-of-the-north-east-marina 
 
Philly Voice: Philly's newest waterfront park opens in Bridesburg later this month 
https://www.phillyvoice.com/philadelphia-bridesburg-borski-park-new-delaware-river-waterfront/ 
 
Tri-County Independent: With 4 Pa. boating fatalities so far this year, extra patrols planned for holiday 
weekend 
https://www.tricountyindependent.com/story/sports/outdoors/2025/07/01/boating-pa-deaths-july-4-
safety/84421405007/ 
 
WNEP 16: Officials urge caution around restricted swimming spots in Luzerne County 
https://www.wnep.com/article/news/local/luzerne-county/caution-luzerne-county-swimming-hole-
summer-drowning/523-a411a2ef-2a45-4752-8edf-700af42eb002 
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Pocono Record: Kalahari Resorts & Conventions marks 10-year anniversary in the Poconos 
https://www.poconorecord.com/story/news/local/2025/07/01/kalahari-poconos-10-year-
anniversary/84424840007/ 
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Danville, MARC to decide on deal; Council will vote on trail maintenance 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/070125/page/1/story/danville-marc-to-decide-on-deal  
 
Centre Daily Times: When will Whitehall Road Regional Park open? 
https://www.centredaily.com/news/local/community/article309241350.html#campaignName=statecoll
ege_morning_newsletter  
 
 
Energy 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Westinghouse Electric lands $180 million contract for groundbreaking fusion 
reactor project 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/06/30/westinghouse-electric-iter-nuclear-
fusion.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Local firm TEN tapped for massive LED upgrade at Pittsburgh International 
Airport 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/06/30/ten-pittsburgh-international-airport-
light.html 
 
The Derrick: Two EV charging stations opening in the area 
https://www.thederrick.com/news/community_news/two-ev-charging-stations-opening-in-the-
area/article_e1c68994-5aaa-4f25-8ff1-310b7ea6b251.html 
 
Warren Times: Debated energy tax credits necessary for state, industry says 
https://www.timesobserver.com/news/local-news/2025/07/debated-energy-tax-credits-necessary-for-
state-industry-says/ 
 
WJET-TV: EV charging stations open in Meadville, other PA locations 
https://www.yourerie.com/digital-first/digital-exclusive/ev-charging-stations-open-in-meadville-other-
pa-locations/ 
 
The Philadelphia Inquirer: The unknown costs of Amazon’s $20 billion promise to build two data centers 
in Pennsylvania 
https://www.inquirer.com/news/pennsylvania/amazon-data-centers-pennsylvania-taxes-
20250701.html?variant=2 
 
Scranton Times: The unknown costs of Amazon’s $20B promise to build 2 data centers in Pennsylvania 
https://www.thetimes-tribune.com/2025/06/30/the-unknown-costs-of-amazons-20b-promise-to-build-
2-data-centers-in-pennsylvania/ 
 
 
Mining 
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Pittsburgh Post-Gazette: After years of investigating deaths and injuries of miners, Pa. mine safety 
center to close doors in August 
https://www.post-gazette.com/news/politics-nation/2025/06/30/msha-coal-mines-safety-inspections-
mt-pleasant-office/stories/202506300070 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Core Natural Resources delays Leer South longwall restart 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/06/30/core-natural-resources-longwall-leer.html 
 
Bucks County Herald: Hilltown drills down on H&K Materials' bids for extended quarry hours 
https://www.buckscountyherald.com/news/hilltown-drills-down-on-h-k-materials-bids-for-extended-
quarry-hours/article_28c7a377-e540-4108-8892-7229b7c638fb.html 
 
 
PFAS 
 
CBS3: How Philadelphia workers' strike will impact the water department and your service 
https://www.cbsnews.com/philadelphia/news/philadelphia-strike-water-bill-department-impacts/ 
 
PA Environment Digest: EPA Releases $36,923,000 To Pennsylvania To Address PFAS 'Forever Chemical' 
Contamination Of Drinking Water In Small & Disadvantaged Communities 
https://paenvironmentdaily.blogspot.com/2025/06/epa-releases-36923000-to-pennsylvania.html  
 
PA Senate Republican Caucus: Yaw, Miller to Introduce Bill Limiting Use of PFAS in Firefighting Foam 
https://www.pasenategop.com/news/yaw-miller-to-introduce-bill-limiting-use-of-pfas-in-firefighting-
foam/  
 
 
Waste 
 
The Philadelphia Inquirer: Philly DC 33 strike: Where to drop off your trash and recycling 
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/philly-strike-trash-garbage-recycling-drop-off-sites-
20250701.html?variant=2 
 
The Philadelphia Inquirer: DC 33 strike in Philly: Garbage collection halted, city sues to force some 
workers back; live updates 
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/live/philadelphia-strike-dc-33-impact-services-trash-
garbage-updates-20250701.html?variant=2 
 
CBS3: What happens to trash pickup in Philadelphia with city workers on strike? What to know as DC 33 
strike starts 
https://www.cbsnews.com/philadelphia/news/philadelphia-dc-33-strike-trash-pickup/ 
 
6abc: How DC 33 strike will impact trash collection in Philadelphia 
https://6abc.com/post/philadelphia-strike-how-trash-pickup-would-impacted-dc-33-hits-picket-
line/16894993/ 
 
Scranton Times: Improved Scranton recycling collection begins next week 

https://www.post-gazette.com/news/politics-nation/2025/06/30/msha-coal-mines-safety-inspections-mt-pleasant-office/stories/202506300070
https://www.post-gazette.com/news/politics-nation/2025/06/30/msha-coal-mines-safety-inspections-mt-pleasant-office/stories/202506300070
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/06/30/core-natural-resources-longwall-leer.html
https://www.buckscountyherald.com/news/hilltown-drills-down-on-h-k-materials-bids-for-extended-quarry-hours/article_28c7a377-e540-4108-8892-7229b7c638fb.html
https://www.buckscountyherald.com/news/hilltown-drills-down-on-h-k-materials-bids-for-extended-quarry-hours/article_28c7a377-e540-4108-8892-7229b7c638fb.html
https://www.cbsnews.com/philadelphia/news/philadelphia-strike-water-bill-department-impacts/
https://paenvironmentdaily.blogspot.com/2025/06/epa-releases-36923000-to-pennsylvania.html
https://www.pasenategop.com/news/yaw-miller-to-introduce-bill-limiting-use-of-pfas-in-firefighting-foam/
https://www.pasenategop.com/news/yaw-miller-to-introduce-bill-limiting-use-of-pfas-in-firefighting-foam/
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/philly-strike-trash-garbage-recycling-drop-off-sites-20250701.html?variant=2
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/philly-strike-trash-garbage-recycling-drop-off-sites-20250701.html?variant=2
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/live/philadelphia-strike-dc-33-impact-services-trash-garbage-updates-20250701.html?variant=2
https://www.inquirer.com/news/philadelphia/live/philadelphia-strike-dc-33-impact-services-trash-garbage-updates-20250701.html?variant=2
https://www.cbsnews.com/philadelphia/news/philadelphia-dc-33-strike-trash-pickup/
https://6abc.com/post/philadelphia-strike-how-trash-pickup-would-impacted-dc-33-hits-picket-line/16894993/
https://6abc.com/post/philadelphia-strike-how-trash-pickup-would-impacted-dc-33-hits-picket-line/16894993/


https://www.thetimes-tribune.com/2025/06/30/improved-scranton-recycling-collection-begins-next-
week/ 
 
 
Water 
 
WESA: National water conference coming to Pittsburgh 
https://www.wesa.fm/environment-energy/2025-07-01/pittsburgh-one-water-summit-conference 
 
Lancaster Online: Overnight flooding impacts thousands in Lancaster County 
https://lancasteronline.com/news/local/overnight-flooding-impacts-thousands-in-lancaster-
county/article_33038a9d-c486-4c9e-afa8-791420aac65c.html 
 
ABC27: Floods drown out Lancaster County roadways in aftermath of Monday’s storms 
https://www.abc27.com/local-news/lancaster/floods-drowns-out-lancaster-county-roadways-in-
aftermath-of-mondays-storms/ 
 
CBS21: Over 50 water rescues reported after drivers get stuck in Lancaster County flood waters 
https://local21news.com/news/local/crews-respond-to-water-rescues-throughout-lancaster-county-
after-flooding-cars-stranded-stuck-flood-waters-rain-weather-warning-roads-traffic-pennsylvania-pa 
 
CBS21: Lititz bridge washed out by flood waters 
https://local21news.com/news/local/flooding-washes-out-lititz-bridge-evans-road-national-weather-
service-rain-storm-flood-waters-pennsylvania-lancaster-county-pa# 
 
CBS21: Veolia customers frustrated as discolored water persists despite days of system flushing 
https://local21news.com/news/local/veolia-customers-frustrated-as-discolored-water-persists-despite-
days-of-system-flushing# 
 
FOX43: Manheim area in Lancaster County warns residents of overflowing sewer system 
https://www.fox43.com/article/news/local/lancaster-county/manheim-area-in-lancaster-county-warns-
of-overflowing-sewer-system/521-9dd0f93c-0839-4f14-8e45-dfeb7551e876 
 
WGAL: Floodwaters cover Lititz Springs Park 
https://www.wgal.com/article/lititz-springs-park-flooding-pennsylvania/65265213 
 
WGAL: Flash flooding washes away road in Lititz 
https://www.wgal.com/article/lancaster-lititz-flash-flooding-washes-away-bridge/65258375 
 
Butler Eagle: Cranberry Township green lights major storm sewer upgrades 
https://www.butlereagle.com/20250701/cranberry-township-green-lights-major-storm-sewer-
upgrades/ 
 
Patch.com: Flood Watch Declared As 2nd Storm Front Nears Eastern PA 
https://patch.com/pennsylvania/across-pa/flood-watch-declared-2nd-storm-front-nears-eastern-pa 
 
Middle Susquehanna Riverkeeper Blog: New GIS mapping tool helps emphasize importance of 
groundwater recharge, helps landowners with decision making 
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https://patch.com/pennsylvania/across-pa/flood-watch-declared-2nd-storm-front-nears-eastern-pa


https://www.middlesusquehannariverkeeper.org/blog/new-gis-mapping-tool-helps-emphasize-
importance-of-groundwater-recharge-helps-landowners-with-decision-making  
 
 
Miscellaneous 
 
WJAC: Complaint filed against UGI, plumbing company after home explosion in Susquehanna Township 
https://wjactv.com/news/local/complaint-filed-against-ugi-plumbing-company-after-home-explosion-in-
susquehanna-township# 
 
Tribune-Review: CMU's Tartan Driver takes autonomous driving off Pittsburgh's beaten path 
https://triblive.com/business/technology/cmus-tartan-driver-takes-autonomous-driving-off-pittsburghs-
beaten-path/ 
 
Lancaster Online: Lancaster County will not renew contract with HazMat 2, cites concerns over possible 
'fund misuse' 
https://lancasteronline.com/news/local/lancaster-county-will-not-renew-contract-with-hazmat-2-cites-
concerns-over-possible-fund-misuse/article_be26d805-c664-406a-b0af-80e438541b32.html 
 
ABC27: Lancaster County refers hazmat team’s “questionable expenses” to District Attorney 
https://www.abc27.com/local-news/lancaster-county-refers-hazmat-teams-questionable-expenses-to-
district-attorney/ 
 
Reading Eagle: Thousands of Philadelphia city workers go on strike, affecting trash pickup, pools and 911 
calls 
https://www.readingeagle.com/2025/07/01/philadelphia-city-workers-strike/ 
 
WITF: The unknown costs of Amazon’s $20B promise to build 2 data centers in Pennsylvania 
https://www.witf.org/2025/06/30/the-unknown-costs-of-amazons-20b-promise-to-build-2-data-
centers-in-pennsylvania/ 
 
The Philly Tribune: Flint's still-unfinished lead pipe replacement serves as cautionary tale to other cities 
https://www.phillytrib.com/news/across_america/flints-still-unfinished-lead-pipe-replacement-serves-
as-cautionary-tale-to-other-cities/article_574b1260-cb6d-4128-bc70-8e420eb57552.html 
 
WFMZ: Allentown zoners OK partial demo of historic bank building in Center City 
https://www.wfmz.com/news/area/lehighvalley/lehigh-county/allentown-area/allentown-zoners-ok-
partial-demo-of-historic-bank-building-in-center-city/article_4d08f8d8-d33b-47ee-a8fa-
43178456ed2b.html 
 
Citizen’s Voice: Analysis of Horton Street sinkhole continues in Wilkes-Barre 
https://www.citizensvoice.com/2025/06/30/analysis-of-horton-street-sinkhole-continues-in-wilkes-
barre/ 
 
WOWK-TV: EPA employees put names to ‘declaration of dissent’ over agency moves under Trump 
https://www.wowktv.com/news/ap-epa-employees-put-names-to-declaration-of-dissent-over-agency-
moves-under-trump/  
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