
Some clips may be behind a paywall.  If Regional employees need access to these clips, please contact 
your Regional Communications Manager (NWRO – Tom Decker; NCRO – Megan Lehman; NERO – Patti 
Monahan; SERO – Robyn Briggs; SCRO – John Repetz; SWRO – Laina Aquiline). If Central Office staff (and 
others outside of DEP) need access to these clips, please email me at brandongla@pa.gov 
 
 
Top DEP Stories 
 
6abc: Pa. DEP updates Bucks Co. residents on pipeline leak response 
https://6abc.com/post/pa-dep-updates-bucks-county-residents-pipeline-leak-response/17140350/ 
 
NBC Philadelphia: Upper Makefield residents seek answers after jet fuel found in drinking water 
https://www.nbcphiladelphia.com/news/local/upper-makefield-jet-fuel-drinking-water/4234564/ 
 
Central Penn Business Journal: DEP cuts permit backlog 98% with tech, new programs 
https://www.cpbj.com/dep-cuts-permit-backlog-98-with-tech-new-programs/ 
 
 
Mentions 
 
Bradford Era: Mosquito spraying underway 
https://www.bradfordera.com/2025/07/16/mosquito-spraying-underway/ 
 
Bayfront East Side Taskforce Launches Same Day Work and Pay Cleanup Program 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/52924947/bayfront-east-side-taskforce-launches-same-day-
work-and-pay-cleanup-program 
 
Wellsboro Gazette: Authority approves agreement with borough to change to operating type 
https://www.tiogapublishing.com/free_press_courier/news/local/authority-approves-agreement-with-
borough-to-change-to-operating-type/article_ada8f963-b6c6-4790-b40a-227e43975b9d.html  
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Yaw reappointed to environmental committee 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/yaw-reappointed-to-environmental-committee/ 
 
Milton Standard-Journal: West Nile Virus detected in Union County 
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_38b18db9-5397-473f-b014-9e169eb5d9bc.html  
 
 
Air 
 
Erie Times: Feds cite 'deleted database' in request to dismiss an Erie Coke case 
https://www.goerie.com/story/news/crime/2025/07/16/feds-cite-deleted-database-request-dismiss-
erie-pa-coke-case-david-stablein-anthony-nearhoof/85210571007/ 
 
 
Conservation and Recreation 
 
KDKA: Elusive fisher and kits captured on Westmoreland County trail cam 
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https://www.cbsnews.com/pittsburgh/news/fisher-kits-westmoreland-county-trail-camera/ 
 
Erie Times: Presque Isle State Park issues swimming ban for popular beach due to E. coli levels 
https://www.goerie.com/story/news/healthcare/2025/07/15/presque-isle-state-park-issues-swimming-
ban-popular-beach-e-coli/85205557007/?tbref=hp 
 
Lancaster Farming: Chesapeake Bay Alliance, CNH Host Field Day for Conservation 
https://www.lancasterfarming.com/farming-news/conservation/chesapeake-bay-alliance-cnh-host-
field-day-for-conservation/article_06cee7ab-caf6-4198-aef1-efe55226be40.html 
 
WFMZ: Reading and Allentown mayors discourage swimming in city waterways, say violators could face 
fines 
https://www.wfmz.com/news/area/berks/reading-and-allentown-mayors-discourage-swimming-in-city-
waterways-say-violators-could-face-fines/article_22310a19-77cf-499e-a109-703ec2dc1df7.html 
 
WNEP16: Park in Wyoming County closed until further notice 
https://www.wnep.com/article/news/local/wyoming-county/wyoming-county-park-closed-until-
further-notice-seneca-trail-county-park-eaton-township/523-087ac8cc-dae6-4ecb-b68f-
ba0a60059113?ref=exit-recirc 
 
WNEP16: Two boaters injured in fire at Pike County lake 
https://www.wnep.com/article/news/local/pike-county/pike-county-boat-fire-tafton-lake-
wallenpaupack/523-c948751f-08fd-4b13-9770-8d80b94c942a?tbref=hp 
 
Wyoming County Examiner: River Day on July 19 will feature music, food and fun in Riverside Park 
https://www.wcexaminer.com/2025/07/16/river-day-on-july-19-will-feature-music-food-and-fun-in-
riverside-park/ 
 
Wellsboro Gazette: County to pursue government council to oversee ATV trail network 
https://www.tiogapublishing.com/the_wellsboro_mansfield_gazette/news/local/county-to-pursue-
government-council-to-oversee-atv-trail-network/article_b4e92916-08af-45fd-b728-8c62e70c0ab5.html  
 
Clearfield Progress-News: DCNR fair booth aims to educate 
https://www.theprogressnews.com/news/local/dcnr-fair-booth-aims-to-educate/article_10b1f38c-
d0a7-47f4-b93a-e46938063013.html  
 
StateCollege.com: Inside/Outside State College: Trails Abound 
https://www.statecollege.com/articles/community/inside-outside-state-college-trails-abound/  
 
 
Energy 
 
Beaver County Times: Digital gold rush? Amid AI boom, lawmakers seize on need for data centers 
https://www.timesonline.com/story/news/local/2025/07/16/amid-ai-boom-lawmakers-seize-on-need-
for-data-centers-pennsylvania/85209351007/ 
 
Daily American: Trump, McCormick unveil $90 billion in private investment in Pa. energy, AI projects 
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https://www.dailyamerican.com/story/news/politics/state/2025/07/15/trump-energy-projects-
mccormick-summit/85216108007/ 
 
Pittsburgh Post-Gazette: At Pittsburgh energy and tech summit, optimism and warnings over future of AI 
https://www.post-gazette.com/news/politics-local/2025/07/15/ai-energy-summit-
pittsburgh/stories/202507150090 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Trump touts $90 billion in energy and tech investments for Pennsylvania at 
Pittsburgh summit 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/trump-mccormick-90-b-energy-
investment.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Westinghouse considers 10 new nuclear reactors in U.S. 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/westinghouse-electric-nuclear-
expansion.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Frontier Group unveils $3.2B plan to convert Bruce Mansfield plant into 
natural gas power station 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/bruce-mansfield-natural-gas-coal.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Energy leaders warn of power shortfall in AI competition, urge swift action 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/anthropic-artificial-intelligence-energy-
race.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Trump touts $90 billion in energy and tech investments for Pennsylvania at 
Pittsburgh summit 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/trump-mccormick-90-b-energy-
investment.html 
 
WTAE: Energy summit: Trump speaks on plans for nuclear power plant reactors 
https://www.wtae.com/article/energy-summit-trump-plans-nuclear-power-plant-reactors-western-
pa/65418002 
 
WTAE: "Forefront of the AI technological revolution" Trump speaks in Pittsburgh at Energy & Innovation 
Summit 
https://www.wtae.com/article/trump-pittsburgh-carneigie-mellon-energy-ai-summit/65398493 
 
WESA: Trump rolls out AI and energy-related investments during Carnegie Mellon University summit 
https://www.wesa.fm/politics-government/2025-07-15/trump-ai-energy-investments-carnegie-mellon-
university-summit 
 
Beaver County Radio: Westinghouse to Accelerate United States Nuclear Reactor Construction and 
Enhance Operations with Google Cloud AI 
https://beavercountyradio.com/news/westinghouse-to-accelerate-united-states-nuclear-reactor-
construction-and-enhance-operations-with-google-cloud-ai/ 
 
Allegheny Front: As more data centers connect to Pennsylvania’s electric grid, some worry prices will 
spike 
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https://www.alleghenyfront.org/data-centers-pennsylvanias-electric-grid-rates/ 
 
Allegheny Front: Pennsylvania is ‘poised to lead the next era’ in AI and energy, McCormick says at CMU 
summit 
https://www.alleghenyfront.org/pennsylvania-ai-and-energy-mccormick-trump/ 
 
Tribune-Review: A look at the blockbuster deals announced at the Pa. Energy and Innovation Summit 
https://triblive.com/business/technology/a-look-at-the-blockbuster-deals-announced-at-the-pa-energy-
and-innovation-summit/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Trump joins McCormick at CMU to tout $90B energy and AI investment wave 
https://triblive.com/news/politics-election/90b-in-energy-ai-deals-could-start-economic-renaissance-in-
pa-mccormick-says/ 
 
Union Progress: From the Next Gen Newsroom: Digital gold rush? Amid AI boom, lawmakers seize on 
need for data centers 
https://www.unionprogress.com/2025/07/15/from-the-next-gen-newsroom-digital-gold-rush-amid-ai-
boom-lawmakers-seize-on-need-for-data-centers/ 
 
Lancaster Online: A look inside a lab making the advanced fuel to power growing US nuclear energy 
ambitions 
https://lancasteronline.com/news/national/a-look-inside-a-lab-making-the-advanced-fuel-to-power-
growing-us-nuclear-energy/article_99eae039-c3b2-5dd0-ad53-197e992107ad.html 
 
York Daily Record: Trump, McCormick unveil $90 billion in private investment in Pa. energy, AI projects 
https://www.ydr.com/story/news/politics/state/2025/07/15/trump-energy-projects-mccormick-
summit/85216108007/ 
 
Reading Eagle: Pennsylvania is getting $90 billion in energy, AI investments. See the full list of projects 
announced by Trump, McCormick 
https://www.readingeagle.com/2025/07/15/pennsylvania-energy-investments-list-trump-mccormick/ 
 
Lebtown.com: N. Annville Twp. supervisors discuss Clear Spring Rd. closure, solar proposal 
https://lebtown.com/2025/07/16/n-annville-twp-supervisors-discuss-clear-spring-rd-closure-solar-
proposal/ 
 
Altoona Mirror: Trump touts Pa. energy, AI investments 
https://www.altoonamirror.com/news/local-news/2025/07/trump-touts-pa-energy-ai-investments/ 
 
Standard Speaker: County council committee opposes PPL transmission line in Sugarloaf Valley, 
postpones vote on plastics plant 
https://www.standardspeaker.com/2025/07/15/county-council-committee-opposes-ppl-transmission-
line-in-the-sugarloaf-valley-postpones-vote-on-plastics-pyrolysis-plant-in-sugarloaf-twp/ 
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Shamokin Dam gas plant to see $3 billion upgrade 
https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2025/07/shamokin-dam-gas-plant-to-see-3-billion-
upgrade/  
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Politics PA: Capital Power Commits $4B to Pennsylvania Energy Development in Shamokin Dam 
https://www.politicspa.com/capital-power-commits-4b-to-pennsylvania-energy-development-in-
shamokin-dam/142104/  
 
DuBois Courier-Express: Punxsutawney Borough Council approves $10 million bond for solar farm 
project 
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/punxsutawney-borough-council-approves-10-million-bond-
for-solar-farm-project/article_97f99b06-e11f-4ef5-8d3c-88c132494aae.html  
 
Milton Standard-Journal: Capital Power acquires Shamokin Dam natural gas facility 
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_9bf83968-5ce5-4c0b-b8d9-40924d6c15f1.html  
 
Milton Standard-Journal: School solar program in danger of going dark  
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_f595fc09-a9fd-4fda-9bb0-20ade369ba44.html  
 
Milton Standard-Journal: Energy storage company to open Muncy facility 
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_797f4f04-4e38-46dc-8653-301dc8af605f.html  
 
Sunbury Daily Item: Hummel Station purchased for $1.3 billion by Canadian company 
https://www.dailyitem.com/news/hummel-station-purchased-for-1-3-billion-by-canadian-
company/article_d1863c7c-4ba8-426d-8c16-bf27e10b94b0.html  
 
 
Oil and Gas 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Leatherstocking planning Wyalusing pipeline 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/leatherstocking-planning-wyalusing-pipeline/  
 
DuBois Courier-Express: Gas prices continue to slide in PA 
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/local/gas-prices-continue-to-slide-in-
pennsylvania/article_2e409813-0a55-4a93-8452-7c494c2ed7ef.html  
 
 
PFAS 
 
Allegheny Front: Penn State study finds toxic PFAS in 18% of private wells in Pennsylvania 
https://www.alleghenyfront.org/penn-state-study-toxic-pfas-18-percent-of-private-wells-pennsylvania/ 
 
 
Waste 
 
CBS21: Mount Joy Borough to set up dumpsters for storm-damaged items following flooding 
https://local21news.com/news/local/mount-joy-borough-to-set-up-dumpsters-for-storm-damaged-
items-following-flash-flooding-monday-public-works-maintenance-building-melhorn-drive-compost-site-
jacob-street-trash-dispose-pennsylvania-weather-pa# 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: First Universalist Church making America green again 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/first-universalist-church-making-america-green/  
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Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Overwhelming crowds, mess lead to park closure 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/overwhelming-crowds-mess-lead-to-park-closure/  
 
 
Water 
 
Daily American: High Point Lake to be drawn down partially for maintenance 
https://www.dailyamerican.com/story/news/local/2025/07/15/auxiliary-spillway-to-be-inspected-
during-high-point-lake-drawdown-somerset-county/85042768007/ 
 
WTAE: Crews on scene of water main break in Oakmont 
https://www.wtae.com/article/crews-on-scene-of-water-main-break-in-oakmont/65422661 
 
Daily Courier: New Haven plans to expand water rescue 
https://www.dailycourier.com/news/new-haven-plans-to-expand-water-rescue/article_5e7cd82e-6207-
4175-80d9-702ebb33cd04.html 
 
Pennlive: Work finally started to upgrade second largest flood control system in Pa. 
https://www.pennlive.com/news/2025/07/work-finally-started-to-upgrade-second-largest-flood-
control-system-in-pa.html 
 
York Dispatch:: York County collecting storm damage reports to determine possible financial aid 
https://www.yorkdispatch.com/story/news/local/2025/07/15/york-county-collecting-storm-damage-
reports-for-possible-financial-aid/85204495007/ 
 
Altoona Mirror: Canoe Creek closed to swimming 
https://www.altoonamirror.com/news/local-news/2025/07/area-news-in-brief-from-around-the-
region-canoe-creek-tyrone-bedford/ 
 
Huntingdon Daily News: Snyder hears drainage issues 
https://www.huntingdondailynews.com/daily_herald/snyder-hears-drainage-issues/article_2ded34f7-
3fb4-4ef9-96ac-a60c2d5a1309.html 
 
WFMZ: Deadline looms for decision on future of Christman Lake 
https://www.wfmz.com/news/area/berks/deadline-looms-for-decision-on-future-of-christman-
lake/article_a29a0e0e-88ba-4b38-a305-f146f4d4ba67.html 
 
Citizens Voice: Flash flood waters force dozens to evacuate from Fairmount Twp. religious camp 
https://www.citizensvoice.com/2025/07/14/flash-food-waters-force-dozens-to-evacuate-from-
fairmount-twp-religious-camp/ 
 
Sunbury Daily Item: Flash flood watch in place until midnight Wednesday 
https://www.dailyitem.com/news/flash-flood-watch-in-place-until-midnight-
wednesday/article_f83270cc-4f6c-4510-8b5b-bccaa09064e6.html  
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Heavy rains bring flooding throughout Sullivan, eastern Lycoming counties 
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https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2025/07/heavy-rains-bring-flooding-throughout-sullivan-
eastern-lycoming-counties/  
 
Renovo Record: City Chooses Projects for Potentially Last CDBG Federal Funds 
https://therecord-online.com/site/archives/127369  
 
Wellsboro Gazette: County approves $250k loan, $22k grant for Roseville project 
https://www.tiogapublishing.com/the_wellsboro_mansfield_gazette/news/local/county-approves-
250k-loan-22k-grant-for-roseville-project/article_5f44213a-f7e2-4947-a3f5-38f969109170.html  
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: New leak appears in Laceyville water system 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/new-leak-appears-in-laceyville-water-system/  
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: No update on Laceyville water crisis 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/no-update-on-laceyville-water-crisis/  
 
DuBois Courier-Express: Sykesville Borough Council: Stormwater project at Stahl Park now underway 
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/sykesville-borough-council-stormwater-project-at-stahl-
park-now-underway/article_eaf0a303-4169-44dd-b61d-463c1add8b62.html  
 
Milton Standard-Journal: Union County receives $700K in grant funding requests; $200K available 
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_2b49515f-91da-42f0-9b12-4ac7c3c9d26e.html 
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Family yielding to third flood; Commissioners sign disaster declaration 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/071625/page/1/story/family-yielding-to-third-flood   
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Camp starts cleanup post-flood 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/071625/page/1/story/camp-starts-cleanup  
 
 
Miscellaneous 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: What's next for Pittsburgh after big-time summit? 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/whats-next-for-pittsburgh-after-big-time-
summit.html 
 
Republican Herald: Statewide 911 outage caused no local delays to response time, officials say 
https://www.republicanherald.com/2025/07/15/statewide-911-outage-caused-no-local-delays-to-
response-time-officials-say/ 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Montrose area plant will produce and sell lithium 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/montrose-area-plant-will-produce-and-sell-lithium/   
 
StateCollege.com: Op-Ed: Loss of CDBG, HOME Funds Would Prove Devastating for State College 
https://www.statecollege.com/articles/opinion/op-ed-loss-of-cdbg-home-funds-would-prove-
devastating-for-state-college/  
 
 

https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2025/07/heavy-rains-bring-flooding-throughout-sullivan-eastern-lycoming-counties/
https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2025/07/heavy-rains-bring-flooding-throughout-sullivan-eastern-lycoming-counties/
https://therecord-online.com/site/archives/127369
https://www.tiogapublishing.com/the_wellsboro_mansfield_gazette/news/local/county-approves-250k-loan-22k-grant-for-roseville-project/article_5f44213a-f7e2-4947-a3f5-38f969109170.html
https://www.tiogapublishing.com/the_wellsboro_mansfield_gazette/news/local/county-approves-250k-loan-22k-grant-for-roseville-project/article_5f44213a-f7e2-4947-a3f5-38f969109170.html
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/new-leak-appears-in-laceyville-water-system/
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/no-update-on-laceyville-water-crisis/
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/sykesville-borough-council-stormwater-project-at-stahl-park-now-underway/article_eaf0a303-4169-44dd-b61d-463c1add8b62.html
https://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/sykesville-borough-council-stormwater-project-at-stahl-park-now-underway/article_eaf0a303-4169-44dd-b61d-463c1add8b62.html
https://www.standard-journal.com/news/local/article_2b49515f-91da-42f0-9b12-4ac7c3c9d26e.html
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/071625/page/1/story/family-yielding-to-third-flood
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/071625/page/1/story/camp-starts-cleanup
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/whats-next-for-pittsburgh-after-big-time-summit.html
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2025/07/15/whats-next-for-pittsburgh-after-big-time-summit.html
https://www.republicanherald.com/2025/07/15/statewide-911-outage-caused-no-local-delays-to-response-time-officials-say/
https://www.republicanherald.com/2025/07/15/statewide-911-outage-caused-no-local-delays-to-response-time-officials-say/
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/montrose-area-plant-will-produce-and-sell-lithium/
https://www.statecollege.com/articles/opinion/op-ed-loss-of-cdbg-home-funds-would-prove-devastating-for-state-college/
https://www.statecollege.com/articles/opinion/op-ed-loss-of-cdbg-home-funds-would-prove-devastating-for-state-college/

