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Mentions 
 
KDKA: 5,000-6,000 Gallons Of Gas Spilled Into Washington County Stream  
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2021/12/01/gas-spill-washington-county-creek/  
 
WPXI: Thousands of gallons of gas spill into Washington County creek, neighbors report feeling sick 
https://www.wpxi.com/news/top-stories/thousands-gallons-gas-spill-into-washington-county-creek-
neighbors-report-feeling-sick/DTFEFKNXANFGHLRPYUTYLG5C3M/  
 
KDKA Radio: Department of Environmental Protection investigates oil spill in Eighty Four  
https://www.audacy.com/kdkaradio/news/local/dep-investigates-oil-spill-in-eighty-four  
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Bay Journal: Drilling wastewater road dumping debated by DEP, oil and gas 
companies, environmentalists 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/news/roads/bay-journal-drilling-wastewater-road-dumping-debated-
by-dep-oil-and-gas-companies-environmentalists/article 2cc46618-5214-11ec-9df5-af9ae8c23935.html 
 
Conservation & Recreation 
 
Pennlive: Cumberland County gives OK to Land Partnerships Grant Program funding for seven projects 
https://www.pennlive.com/news/2021/12/cumberland-county-gives-ok-to-land-partnerships-grant-
program-funding-for-seven-projects.html 
 
Bradford Era: Registration open for 2022 Winter Women in the Wilds 
https://www.bradfordera.com/news/registration-open-for-2022-winter-women-in-the-
wilds/article 9d85a371-3aa5-5d2a-8143-83571bdf35af.html 
 
Kane Republican: Allegheny National Forest Accepting Natural Resource Project Proposals in Forest 
County (pg 3) 
https://kanerepublican.pressreader.com/kane-republican 
 
The Derrick: Allegheny National Forest accepting project proposals 
https://www.thederrick.com/news/community news/allegheny-national-forest-accepting-project-
proposals/article 8fe6f1e0-52da-11ec-bf3a-07aaf25c1aa8.html 
 
Times observer: Audubon Cuts Ribbon on New Wildlife Habitat 
https://www.timesobserver.com/news/community/2021/12/audubon-cuts-ribbon-on-new-wildlife-
habitat/ 
 
Tribune-Review: People who use Great Allegheny Passage pump about $120M into economy, study 
finds  
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/people-who-use-great-allegheny-passage-pump-about-120m-
into-economy-study-finds/  
 
Tribune-Review: Pittsburgh City Council looks to ban parking in bike lanes, with some exceptions 



https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-city-council-looks-to-ban-parking-in-bike-lanes-with-some-
exceptions/  
 
Post-Gazette: City Council considers legislation to ban parking in bike lanes 
https://www.post-gazette.com/frontpage/2021/12/01/Pittsburgh-City-Council-ban-parking-in-bike-
lanes-Residential-Parking-Permits-for-landlords/stories/202112010139 
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Environmental program promotes next generation of environmental workers 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/life/outdoors/environmental-program-promotes-next-generation-of-
environmental-workers/article b6635c8a-52c8-11ec-86b3-8b3b1ba8f51b.html  
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Operate a ski resort!  DCNR still hoping to bring winter sports back to Potter Co. 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/life/operate-a-ski-resort-dcnr-still-hoping-to-bring-winter-sports-
back-to-potter-co/article d8930936-511f-11ec-96dd-7b8261815469.html  
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Tioga County residents invited to participate in the annual Christmas Bird Count 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/life/tioga-county-residents-invited-to-participate-in-the-annual-
christmas-bird-count/article a61dc37e-476a-11ec-82fe-97cd98717c9c.html  
 
Energy 
 
Pennlive: Pennsylvania should pursue all energy resources to manage skyrocketing costs this winter 
https://www.pennlive.com/lottery/2021/11/pennsylvania-should-pursue-all-energy-resources-to-
manage-skyrocketing-costs-this-winter-opinion.html 
 
Bradford Era: Pa. consumer bills up as natural gas takes electricity along for ride 
https://www.bradfordera.com/news/pa-consumer-bills-up-as-natural-gas-takes-electricity-along-for-
ride/article b0c42c3b-a67d-5222-abf0-d4dc2296c407.html 
 
Tribune-Review: Editorial: Freeze out energy costs by controlling your heating bills  
https://triblive.com/opinion/editorial-freeze-out-energy-costs-by-controlling-your-heating-bills/  
 
Oil and Gas 
 
Pennlive: PA taxpayers are paying more for natural gas in not just energy bills 
https://www.pennlive.com/opinion/2021/12/pa-taxpayers-are-paying-more-for-natural-gas-in-not-just-
energy-bills-pennlive-letters.html 
 
Tribune-Review: National drop in gas prices skips Pittsburgh area, frustrating drivers 
https://triblive.com/local/regional/national-drop-in-gas-prices-skips-pittsburgh-area-frustrating-drivers/  
 
Waste 
 
KDKA: North Versailles Man Arrested In Illegal Trash Dumping Incidents  
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2021/12/01/man-arrested-in-illegal-dumping-incidents-pittsburgh/  
 
WPXI: Repeat offender caught in the act again reportedly dumping trash in Pittsburgh neighborhood 



https://www.wpxi.com/news/top-stories/repeat-offender-caught-act-again-reportedly-dumping-trash-
pittsburgh-neighborhood/MXTN2CRFUFGARAOTMC6EYYDDLY/  
 
KDKA Radio: Pittsburgh enforcing illegal dumping around city  
https://www.audacy.com/kdkaradio/news/local/pittsburgh-enforcing-illegal-dumping-around-city 
 
Shamokin News-Item: Artificial turf recycler establishing facility in Luzerne County 
https://www.newsitem.com/business/artificial-turf-recycler-establishing-facility-in-luzerne-
county/article 4d871e57-4dd2-549c-bf40-aadfd740c909.html 
 
Water 
 
Observer-Reporter: A River Runs Through It: Monongahela River a River of the Year contender  
https://observer-reporter.com/news/a-river-runs-through-it-monongahela-river-a-river-of-the-year-
contender/article 9540dbfc-5202-11ec-8938-ab8d700b27c1.html 
 
Chesapeake Bay Journal: Nutrient pollution in Bay’s 3 largest rivers trending downward, but smaller 
rivers show degraded conditions 
https://www.bayjournal.com/news/pollution/nutrient-pollution-in-bay-s-3-largest-rivers-trending-
downward/article 17e9d43e-5387-11ec-a3e7-1b98d46f9888.html  
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Vote Catawissa Creek to recognition 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/120221/page/3/story/vote-catawissa-creek-to-
recognition  
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Danville residents report leak in water line, fearing waste 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/120221/page/1/story/danville-residents-report-leak-in-
water-line-fearing-waste  
 
Middle Susquehanna Riverkeeper Blog: New book by Middle Susquehanna Riverkeeper Association aims 
to raise awareness, spark collaboration 
http://www.middlesusquehannariverkeeper.org/blog/new-book-by-middle-susquehanna-riverkeeper-
association-aims-to-raise-awareness-spark-collaboration 
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Legislators invite public engagement on stream maintenance, flooding policy 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/life/outdoors/legislators-invite-public-engagement-on-stream-
maintenance-flooding-policy/article d92b7ef6-4c8c-11ec-97cc-3b4731c5e35d.html  
 
Miscellaneous 
 
New Castle News: Former Mahoning racetrack site eyed for industrial park 
https://www.ncnewsonline.com/news/local news/former-mahoning-racetrack-site-eyed-for-industrial-
park/article 42eecfba-52ef-11ec-b8ea-7fc73b9ba574.html 
 
Tribune-Review: Letter to the editor: Westmoreland County taking care of lead problems  
https://triblive.com/opinion/letter-to-the-editor-westmoreland-county-taking-care-of-lead-problems/  
 
Post-Gazette: Lead safety law protects the city’s children 



https://www.post-gazette.com/opinion/letters/2021/12/02/Lead-safety-law-protects-the-city-s-
children/stories/202112020017 


