
Some clips may be behind a paywall.  If you need access to these clips, email me at djagiela@pa.gov.   
 
Mentions 
 
Sharon Herald: Sharpsville water declared safe 
https://www.sharonherald.com/news/sharpsville-water-declared-safe/article 3e38b392-43eb-11ea-
adff-ef222a8f5aba.html 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Conservation District to Hold ‘Open Door’ Day 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/conservation-district-to-hold-open-door-day/ 
 
WTAJ.com: Clearfield County Commissioners to appeal Camp Hope Run Landfill permit 
https://www.wearecentralpa.com/news/local-news/clearfield-county-commissioners-to-appeal-camp-
hope-run-landfill-permit/ 
 
Lock Haven Express: Climate chaos (LTE) 
https://www.lockhaven.com/opinion/letters-to-the-editor/2020/01/climate-chaos/ 
 
Latrobe Bulletin: Regulation issues slowing progress on Keystone trail/sewer project 
https://www.latrobebulletinnews.com/news/local/regulation-issues-slowing-progress-on-keystone-
trail-sewer-project/article aef5edbd-e428-50c2-aee4-3f1d888bfa67.html  
 
Restore Pennsylvania 
 
Beaver County Times: Wolf urges Legislature to pass his Restore PA infrastructure proposal 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20200128/wolf-urges-legislature-to-pass-his-restore-pa-
infrastructure-proposal 
 
WESA: Wolf Dusts Off $4.5 Billion Infrastructure Plan 
https://www.wesa.fm/post/wolf-dusts-45-billion-infrastructure-plan 
 
Air 
 
My ChesCo: Philly Area Experienced 85 Days of Polluted Air in 2018 
https://mychesco.com/a/news/philly-area-experienced-85-days-of-polluted-air-in-2018/ 
 
Philadelphia Inquirer: Philadelphia School District will spend at least $14 million to address asbestos 
crisis 
https://www.inquirer.com/news/school-board-asbestos-principals-union-contracts-20200131.html 
 
Beaver County Times: A decade of cleaner air ended in controversy and questions about Allegheny 
County’s future 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20200130/decade-of-cleaner-air-ended-in-controversy-and-
questions-about-allegheny-countys-future  
 
Beaver County Times: PA receives failing grades from American Lung Association’s annual report 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20200129/pa-receives-failing-grades-from-american-lung-
associations-annual-report 



 
Tribune-Review: U.S. Steel outlines ‘strategic’ upgrades to Mon Valley plants 
https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-allegheny/u-s-steel-outlines-strategic-upgrades-to-mon-valley-
plants/  
 
KDKA: Debate Rages On As Air Quality In Region Ranks Among The Worst In The Nation 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2020/01/30/western-pennsylvania-air-quality-debate/  
 
Post-Gazette: Red ink piles up for U.S. Steel; company says better times ahead 
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/pittsburgh-company-news/2020/01/30/U-S-Steel-fourth-
quarter-losses-Burritt-Mon-Valley-Works-minimill/stories/202001300162  
 
Record-Argus News: Lead, asbestos contamination shuts down Pa. schools 
https://www.recordargusnews.com/articles/lead-asbestos-contamination-shuts-down-pa-schools/ 
 
WICU-TV: Lead, asbestos contamination shuts down Pennsylvania schools 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/41633753/lead-asbestos-contamination-shuts-down-
pennsylvania-schools 
 
Scranton Times: Four Scranton schools to close today in asbestos probe 
https://www.thetimes-tribune.com/news/four-scranton-schools-to-close-today-in-asbestos-probe-
1.2589362 
 
Climate Change 
 
WESA: Pitt Alumni Join Students To Pressure Administration To Divest From Fossil Fuels 
https://www.wesa.fm/post/pitt-alumni-join-students-pressure-administration-divest-fossil-fuels 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Calls for Pitt to divest from fossil fuel companies renewed, with alumni joining the 
advocacy 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/calls-for-pitt-to-divest-from-fossil-fuel-companies-renewed-
with-alumni-joining-the-advocacy/Content?oid=16653160  
 
Daily American: Wanting a better climate 
https://www.dailyamerican.com/news/opinion/letters to the editor/wanting-a-better-
climate/article 78d8c4f4-a340-5727-a4ca-434616f1512e.html 
 
Post-Gazette: A good solution 
https://www.post-gazette.com/opinion/letters/2020/01/30/A-good-solution/stories/202001300088  
 
Tribune-Review: Letter to the editor: Taxpayers & cost of climate action 
https://triblive.com/opinion/letter-to-the-editor-taxpayers-cost-of-climate-action/ 
 
Conservation & Recreation 
 
KDKA: New Regulation No Longer Requires Fishermen To Wear License On Jackets Or Hats 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2020/01/30/fishing-license-regulation-removed/ 
 



Herald-Standard: Ohiopyle Winterfest canceled due to lack of snow 
https://www.heraldstandard.com/community life/community news/ohiopyle-winterfest-canceled-
due-to-lack-of-snow/article e73a41c0-42c1-11ea-8697-ebf89b9957e3.html 
 
Post-Gazette: People in glass houses should deter bird collisions 
https://www.post-gazette.com/life/outdoors/2020/01/30/birds-glass-collision-Pittsburgh-Powder-Mill-
Avian-Research-Center/stories/202001300108 
 
Post-Gazette: Council bill on parks tax money delayed by legal opinion 
https://www.post-gazette.com/news/politics-local/2020/01/29/Council-bill-on-parks-tax-money-
delayed-by-legal-opinion/stories/202001290144 
 
Tribune-Review: Forbes Road Trout Unlimited talks flies, fishing during weekly tying circle 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/forbes-road-trout-unlimited-talks-flies-fishing-during-weekly-
tying-circle/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Saturday opener for deer boosted Pennsylvania hunting license sales 
https://triblive.com/sports/saturday-opener-for-deer-boosted-pennsylvania-hunting-license-sales/ 
 
Gant News: Comments being accepted on draft elk management plan 
https://gantdaily.com/2020/01/30/comments-being-accepted-on-draft-elk-management-plan/ 
 
Lock Haven Express: County allocates $33,776 for agricultural preservation 
https://www.lockhaven.com/news/local-news/2020/01/county-allocates-33776-for-agricultural-
preservation/  
 
Centre County Gazette: With Sections of Millbrook Marsh Boardwalk Closed, Parks & Rec Looks at Short-
Term Repairs, Long-Term Solutions 
http://www.statecollege.com/news/local-news/with-sections-of-millbrook-marsh-boardwalk-closed-
parks-rec-looks-at-shortterm-repairs-longterm-solutions,1482384/ 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: DCNR grant applications available  
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/dcnr-grant-applications-available/ 
 
Bradford Era: Trail Association of the McKean/Elk Divide receives grant for trail improvements 
http://www.bradfordera.com/bradford/trail-association-of-the-mckean-elk-divide-receives-grant-
for/article 9db6fe53-c44c-5d4d-80fb-c14f64e9092c.html 
 
Butler Eagle: Moraine State Park offers options for overnight stays 
http://www.butlereagle.com/article/20200131/NEWS01/701319913/-1/news01 
 
Meadville Tribune: Land donations help conserve more of French Creek watershed 
https://www.meadvilletribune.com/news/land-donations-help-conserve-more-of-french-creek-
watershed/article 4d2aadd0-42ea-11ea-a7f9-bb1a78eb79f8.html 
 
WICU-TV: Nearly $150K in Grants Awarded for Parks, Fields and Trails Projects 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/41637846/nearly-dollar150k-in-grants-awarded-for-parks-fields-
and-trails-projects 



 
Energy 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Duquesne Light CEO's priorities: Improving customer service, diversity 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/28/duquesne-light-ceos-priorities-improving-
customer.html  
 
Daily American: Farming alternatives 
https://www.dailyamerican.com/news/opinion/editorials/farming-alternatives/article 553f50ff-f9de-
59d9-bbb2-8122328df02c.html 
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: ‘Green Future’ meets NIMBY present (Op-Ed) 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/013020/page/17/story/green-future-meets-nimby-
present 
 
NorthcentralPA.com: Geisinger receives sustainable energy grant for new projects 
https://www.northcentralpa.com/life/geisinger-receives-sustainable-energy-grant-for-new-
projects/article 6fafd556-4196-11ea-a4d3-3f3f616baae6.html 
 
New Castle News: Hickory Run Energy Station on schedule for April opening 
https://www.ncnewsonline.com/news/local news/hickory-run-energy-station-on-schedule-for-april-
opening/article 8c774fea-df00-5e53-b687-8a31c15b1e2d.html 
 
Environmental Cleanup & Brownfields 
 
Times News: Fuel delivery driver charged with DUI  
https://www.tnonline.com/fuel-delivery-driver-charged-dui 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: The future of technology and energy come together at Mill 19 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/29/the-future-of-technology-and-energy-
come-together.html  
 
Post-Gazette: Old Hazelwood locomotive roundhouse to host tech, co-working space 
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/development/2020/01/28/Hazelwood-Green-roundhouse-LTV-
Coke-Works-Almono/stories/202001280159 
 
PublicSource: Planning Commission hears plans to transform Hazelwood Green roundhouse  
https://www.publicsource.org/meeting-highlights-pittsburgh-planning-commission/ 
 
Sunbury Daily Item: Preserving environment and economic growth (Op-Ed) 
https://www.dailyitem.com/opinion/preserving-environment-and-economic-growth/article c4a00c80-
52d9-57ab-875a-3c9721ff9f8e.html 
 
NextPittsburgh: Pittsburgh’s first Complete Streets debut at Hazelwood Green 
https://www.nextpittsburgh.com/city-design/pittsburghs-first-complete-streets-debut-at-hazelwood-
green/ 
 
Tribune-Review: New streets, bike lanes open at Hazelwood Green as development takes shape 



https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-allegheny/new-streets-bike-lanes-open-at-hazelwood-green-as-
development-takes-shape/ 
 
WJET: Governor Wolf approves funding to clean up two former industrial sites in Erie and Blair Counties 
to make them available for occupation 
https://www.yourerie.com/news/local-news/governor-wolf-approves-funding-to-clean-up-two-former-
industrial-sites-in-erie-and-blair-counties-to-make-them-available-for-occupation/ 
 
WICU-TV: Grant Awarded to Help Clean up Old Gas Station in Albion 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/41637971/grant-awarded-to-help-clean-up-old-gas-station-in-
albion 
 
Mining 
 
Tribune-Democrat: Revenue stream: Coal Tubin’ founder launches campaign to ensure Stonycreek 
treatment system upgrades continue 
https://www.tribdem.com/news/revenue-stream-coal-tubin-founder-launches-campaign-to-ensure-
stonycreek/article a8ebd322-4314-11ea-8777-ff7e957f157a.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Former Consol president settles discrimination lawsuit against company 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/30/ex-consol-president-settles-discrimination-
lawsuit.html 
 
Post-Gazette: Former Consol exec settles gender discrimination suit with company after last-minute 
witness comes forward 
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/powersource/2020/01/30/Katharine-Fredriksen-settles-with-
Consol-after-last-minute-witness-comes-forward/stories/202001300075 
 
AP: Report: 24 US mining deaths in 2019, the lowest number ever 
https://apnews.com/0678a5b4acc493d2b4d7f724ce441803 
 
Oil and Gas  
 
Philadelphia Inquirer: Newly revealed restrictions challenge redevelopment of bankrupt Philly refinery’s 
land 
https://www.inquirer.com/business/pes-philadelphia-refinery-bankruptcy-auction-deed-restriction-
20200130.html 
 
Observer-Reporter: Range signs contract for all-electric fracking fleet 
https://observer-reporter.com/business/range-signs-contract-for-all-electric-fracking-
fleet/article 3591c4fe-42a6-11ea-8cee-93a77281fa30.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: CNX plans to cut drilling even more in 2020 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/30/cnx-plans-to-cut-drilling-even-more-in-
2020.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: For Range Resources, water recycling key to operations 



https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/29/for-range-resources-water-recycling-key-
to.html 
 
Tribune-Review: Edgeworth council approves restrictions on natural gas development 
https://sewickley.triblive.com/edgeworth-council-approves-restrictions-on-natural-gas-development/ 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Impact fee revenue expected to drop 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/impact-fee-revenue-expected-to-drop/ 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Pa. poll shows support for a fracking ban, but also some support for natural-gas 
drilling in state 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/pa-poll-shows-support-for-a-fracking-ban-but-also-some-
support-for-natural-gas-drilling-in-state/Content?oid=16660198 
 
KDKA: Poll: Pennsylvanians Favor Statewide Ban On Fracking 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2020/01/30/pennsylvanians-favor-a-statewide-ban-on-fracking/  
 
Observer-Reporter: Worker sues well services company over East Finley well pad fire 
https://observer-reporter.com/news/localnews/worker-sues-well-services-company-over-east-finley-
well-pad/article d57c0fbc-436c-11ea-b3ee-b7954747bacf.html 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: CNX CEO: 'It seems like the entire basin in some way, shape or form is for 
sale' 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2020/01/30/cnx-ceo-it-seems-like-the-entire-basin-for-
sale.html  
 
Post-Gazette: Some shale gas reserves aren't what they used to be 
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/powersource/2020/01/31/Marcellus-shale-gas-reserves-CNX-
EQT-Chevron-pennsylvania/stories/202001300154 
 
Vector Management 
 
Beaver County Times: Spotted lanternfly egg masses found in Conway 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20200129/spotted-lanternfly-egg-masses-found-in-conway/1 
 
Wyalusing Rocket-Courier: Potential Economic Impact of Spotted Lanternfly in PA 
https://www.rocket-courier.com/articles/potential-economic-impact-of-spotted-lanternfly-in-pa/ 
 
Waste 
 
WTAJ: Clearfield County Commissioners to appeal Camp Hope Run Landfill permit 
https://www.wearecentralpa.com/news/local-news/clearfield-county-commissioners-to-appeal-camp-
hope-run-landfill-permit/ 
 
Beaver County Radio: Commissioners Get Updates On Closing Of Brush Creek Park & County Recycling 
https://beavercountyradio.com/news/commissioners-get-updates-on-closing-of-brush-creek-park-
county-recycling/  
 



Observer-Reporter: East Washington to partner with South Strabane on glass recycling 
https://observer-reporter.com/news/localnews/east-washington-to-partner-with-south-strabane-on-
glass-recycling/article d7b39008-41d6-11ea-87ce-73d8547217cb.html 
 
Post-Gazette: City adds another $500K in grant money to go toward blue recycling bins 
https://www.post-gazette.com/local/city/2020/01/28/Pittsburgh-grant-Recycling-Partnership-grant-
money-blue-recycling-bins/stories/202001280121 
 
Post-Gazette: As Others See It: China is putting the U.S. to shame in the fight against plastic trash 
https://www.post-gazette.com/opinion/Op-Ed/2020/01/30/As-Others-See-It-China-US-shame-fight-
plastic-trash/stories/202001300036 
 
Tribune-Review: 412 Food Rescue expands mission in Westmoreland, other Western Pa. counties 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/412-food-rescue-expands-mission-in-westmoreland-other-w-
pa-counties/  
 
Tribune-Review: Unity officials clear way for new Westmoreland Cleanways recycling center 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/unity-officials-clear-way-for-new-westmoreland-cleanways-
recycling-center/  
 
Tribune-Review: Yukon area landfill owner to hold meeting on permit 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/yukon-area-landfill-owner-to-hold-meeting-on-permit/ 
 
Water 
 
Republican Herald: SCMA looking to expand Deer Lake sewage plant 
https://www.republicanherald.com/news/scma-looking-to-expand-deer-lake-sewage-plant-1.2589596 
 
York Dispatch: Shiloh Water Authority to reconsider fluoride removal plan 
https://www.yorkdispatch.com/story/news/local/community/2020/01/30/shiloh-water-authority-
reconsider-fluoride-removal-plan/4619165002/ 
 
Central Penn Business Journal: DEP provides funds for county watershed coordinator positions 
https://www.cpbj.com/dep-provides-funds-county-watershed-coordinator-positions/ 
 
GoodRiver/PublicSource: The complicated history of the Kinzua Dam and how it changed life for the 
Seneca people 
https://www.ohiowatershed.org/kinzua-dam-changed-life-for-seneca-people.html  
 
Tribune-Review: State awards Arnold $1.8M loan for sewer reconstruction 
https://triblive.com/local/valley-news-dispatch/state-awards-arnold-1-8m-loan-for-sewer-
reconstruction/ 
 
Allegheny Front; ‘Unbuilding’: What Might Happen if Dams are Removed in the Ohio River Watershed 
https://www.alleghenyfront.org/unbuilding-what-might-happen-if-dams-are-removed-in-the-ohio-river-
watershed/ 
 
Tribune-Democrat: Westmont move saves $500K on sewer lateral line inspections, council says 



https://www.tribdem.com/news/westmont-move-saves-k-on-sewer-lateral-line-inspections-
council/article fe057d80-431a-11ea-9be8-fbb837c72c70.html 
 
Tribune-Review: Preliminary testing shows ‘probable Legionella’ in water at Westmoreland Manor 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/preliminary-testing-shows-probable-legionella-in-water-at-
westmoreland-manor/ 
 
Sunbury Daily Item: Sunbury Municipal Authority receives $2.5 million in loans for water treatment 
upgrades 
https://www.dailyitem.com/news/sunbury-municipal-authority-receives-million-in-loans-for-water-
treatment/article cc3bbf96-42be-11ea-a68f-6bcc4d334932.html 
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Much cleaner Fishing Creek must be kept open (LTE) 
https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/013020/page/17/story/much-cleaner-fishing-creek-must-
be-kept-open 
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Commissioners approve levee work agreement 
https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2020/01/commissioners-approve-levee-work-
agreement/ 
 
DuBois Courier-Express: Jay Township Water Authority to replace Force water lines in spring 
http://www.thecourierexpress.com/news/jay-township-water-authority-to-replace-force-water-lines-
in/article d742fb3f-63fb-5a25-ac2d-4fd41c98e0ff.html  
 
Towanda Daily Review: Athens Township makes progress on Thomas Avenue Bridge project 
https://www.thedailyreview.com/news/local/athens-township-makes-progress-on-thomas-avenue-
bridge-project/article 67e58300-9f1a-5732-b628-4a65f483905a.html 
 
KDKA: Testing Underway After Possible Legionella Bacteria Found In Westmoreland Manor Water 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2020/01/30/westmoreland-manor-legionella-bacteria-testing/ 
 
Latrobe Bulletin: County treating Westmoreland Manor water amid Legionella concerns 
https://www.latrobebulletinnews.com/news/local/county-treating-westmoreland-manor-water-amid-
legionella-concerns/article 4a350745-f91c-5ac6-95af-3093644b5a49.html 
 
Tribune-Review: County begins treating Westmoreland Manor water sources 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/county-begins-treating-westmoreland-manor-water-sources/ 
 
Post-Gazette: Veolia Water Technologies' Moon Township center is up for sale 
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/2020/01/31/Veolia-water-technologies-airside-business-park-
allegheny-county-sale-close-furlough/stories/202001310111 
 
Tribune-Democrat: Lower Yoder Township gets $4 million for sewer project 
https://www.tribdem.com/news/lower-yoder-township-gets-million-for-sewer-
project/article cb940e66-431a-11ea-ac9c-5f0656a53b44.html 
 
Miscellaneous 
 



WITF: New pollinator and bird garden will expand Penn State arboretum by 60 percent 
https://www.witf.org/2020/01/31/new-pollinator-and-bird-garden-will-expand-penn-state-arboretum-
by-60-percent/ 
 
WITF/StatImpact: Philadelphia, state join suit against EPA over chemical-safety rules at industrial sites 
https://stateimpact.npr.org/pennsylvania/2020/01/30/philadelphia-state-join-suit-against-epa-over-
chemical-safety-rules-at-industrial-sites/ 
 
WESA: Wolf Wants To Set Aside A Billion Dollars To Clean Up Schools 
https://www.wesa.fm/post/wolf-wants-set-aside-billion-dollars-clean-schools#stream/0 
 
Lock Haven Express: Lead, asbestos contamination shuts down three Pa. schools 
https://www.lockhaven.com/news/local-news/2020/01/lead-asbestos-contamination-shuts-down-
three-pa-schools/ 
 
Gant News: Purple paint means no trespassing 
https://gantdaily.com/2020/01/31/purple-paint-means-no-trespassing/ 
 
KDKA: Residents On Street In Perry North Still Fearful Almost A Year After Landslide 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2020/01/30/residents-on-street-in-perry-north-still-fearful/  
 
WJAC: Governor floats plan to attack lead, asbestos in schools 
https://wjactv.com/news/local/governor-floats-plan-to-attack-lead-asbestos-in-schools-01-30-2020 
 
Latrobe Bulletin: Residents get look at first portion of Laurel Valley Transportation Improvement Project 
https://www.latrobebulletinnews.com/news/local/residents-get-look-at-first-portion-of-laurel-valley-
transportation/article 74c0751d-e0f8-5bd3-bcf5-a3a0b1ff609a.html 
 
Tribune-Review: Unity eyes zoning changes for windmills, barns, Route 981 development 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/unity-eyes-zoning-changes-for-windmills-barns-route-981-
development/ 
 
Beaver County Times: Eastvale memorial plaques removed after sinkhole damage 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20200130/eastvale-memorial-plaques-removed-after-sinkhole-
damage 
 
Erie Times: Crazy video shows deer charge man in McDonald’s parking lot: ‘Didn’t spill my coke!’ 
https://www.goerie.com/zz/news/20200131/crazy-video-shows-deer-charge-man-in-mcdonalds-
parking-lot-didnt-spill-my-coke 


