
Some clips may be behind a paywall.  If you need access to these clips, email me at djagiela@pa.gov.   
 
High Path Avian Influenza 
 
Lancaster Farming: Redding Plans Quick Rollout of Avian Influenza Aid 
https://www.lancasterfarming.com/farming/poultry/redding-plans-quick-rollout-of-avian-influenza-
aid/article 600a816e-02f5-11ed-bc8c-97ff7b310b38.html 
 
Air 
 
Tribune-Democrat: Letter to the editor | Quaker Sales hopefully finds suitable place  
https://www.tribdem.com/news/editorials/readers forum/letter-to-the-editor-quaker-sales-hopefully-
finds-suitable-place/article 5eb60ada-0201-11ed-9528-07336be49bd7.html  
 
Latrobe Bulletin: Residents concerned with illegal burning within Derry Borough 
https://www.latrobebulletinnews.com/news/local/residents-concerned-with-illegal-burning-within-
derry-borough/article 5cb64498-b1a5-5d2e-abf9-e7a69c0b2840.html 
 
Conservation & Recreation 
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Natural area named for native ornithologist Robert Porter Allen 
https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2022/07/natural-area-named-for-native-ornithologist-
robert-porter-allen/  
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Shrinking firefly population highlighted in Sylvan Dell 
https://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2022/07/shrinking-firefly-population-highlighted-in-
sylvan-dell/   
 
Lebtown.com: Fort Indiantown Gap wraps up 2022 tours of regal fritillary butterfly habitat at base 
https://www.lebtown.com/2022/07/14/fort-indiantown-gap-wraps-up-2022-tours-of-regal-fritillary-
butterfly-habitat-at-base/ 
 
Tribune-Democrat: 'Enjoying the fresh air': Residents of Cambria Care Center, Amber Hills go fishing  
https://www.tribdem.com/news/local news/enjoying-the-fresh-air-residents-of-cambria-care-center-
amber-hills-go-fishing/article 8ae9b6ee-029f-11ed-8185-876de7d05cb5.html 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Gainey administration cuts ties with ONE PGH 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/gainey-administration-cuts-ties-with-one-
pgh/Content?oid=22038333 
 
Energy 
 
Utility Dive: Exelon, PG&E, PSEG and others call on Congress to pass ‘ambitious’ clean energy spending 
package 
https://www.utilitydive.com/news/exelon-pge-pseg-congress-clean-energy-spending/627137/  
 
Reuters: U.S. solar prices soared over 8% in 2nd qtr -report  
https://www.reuters.com/business/energy/us-solar-prices-soared-over-8-2nd-qtr-report-2022-07-14/ 



 
Pittsburgh Business Times: PNC powering Pittsburgh and other legacy markets with renewable energy 
through new deal 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2022/07/13/pnc-powers-renewable-energy.html 
 
Mining 
 
Tribune-Democrat: 'A second chance' | For miner Unger, Quecreek 'miracle' brings opportunity to live 
life to fullest 
https://www.tribdem.com/news/a-second-chance-for-miner-unger-quecreek-miracle-brings-
opportunity-to-live-life-to-fullest/article aa970044-012f-11ed-a55a-e31e245caed8.html  
 
Allegheny Front: Trauma in coil town remains raw after decade on boil water advisory 
https://www.alleghenyfront.org/west-virginia-coal-town-clean-water-access-dig-deep/ 
 
Oil and Gas 
 
Sayre Morning-Times: Local municipalities see big bump in Act 13 revenue 
https://www.morning-times.com/news/article 31cef9f2-946e-59d7-b178-3b1086fdd4f6.html 
 
Post-Gazette: CNX investing in company that makes bioplastics out of greenhouse gasses. CNX will 
supply the gasses.  
https://www.post-gazette.com/business/powersource/2022/07/14/cnx-newlight-technologies-
methane-biodegradable-plastic-substitute-aircarbon-cecil-oil-gas/stories/202207140083 
 
Mon Valley Independent: Rostraver zoning board wants Olympus to provide Route 51 pull-off lane 
https://monvalleyindependent.com/2022/07/rostraver-zoning-board-wants-olympus-to-provide-route-
51-pull-off-lane/  
 
New York Times: Gas Prices, a Big Inflation Factor, Are Coming Down Sharply  
https://www.nytimes.com/2022/07/13/business/energy-environment/gas-prices-inflation.html  
 
Reuters: U.S. gasoline prices are finally falling. Why? 
https://www.reuters.com/business/energy/us-gasoline-prices-are-finally-falling-why-2022-07-14/  
 
Reuters: U.S. natgas futures jump 9% on output drop, hotter forecasts 
https://www.reuters.com/business/energy/us-natgas-futures-jump-9-output-drop-hotter-forecasts-
2022-07-13/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Fitzgerald defends decision to veto Allegheny County parks fracking ban bill 
https://triblive.com/local/fitzgerald-defends-decision-to-veto-allegheny-county-parks-fracking-ban-bill/  
 
Tribune-Review: Letter to the editor: Support proposal to protect our parks 
https://triblive.com/opinion/letter-to-the-editor-support-proposal-to-protect-our-parks/  
 
Post-Gazette: The too high cost of public land fracking 
https://www.post-gazette.com/opinion/letters/2022/07/14/the-too-high-cost-of-public-land-
fracking/stories/202207140022 



 
Post-Gazette: Allegheny County Executive Rich Fitzgerald endorses alternative to vetoed anti-fracking 
bill  
https://www.post-gazette.com/local/region/2022/07/13/allegheny-county-executive-rich-fitzgerald-
facing-veto-pushback-proposes-alternative-fracking-ban-bill-climate-parks/stories/202207130074 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Allegheny County executive vetoes bill to ban fracking in county parks 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2022/07/13/allegheny-county-exec-vetoes-bill-ban-
fracking.html 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Fitzgerald vetoes bills on fracking, executive hires; council president moves to 
override 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/fitzgerald-vetoes-bills-on-climate-executive-hires-council-
president-moves-to-override/Content?oid=22036508 
 
KDKA Radio: Rich Fitzgerald defends vote to veto bill banning fracking in county parks 
https://www.audacy.com/kdkaradio/news/local/allegheny-county-executive-rich-fitzgerald-plans-to-
veto-fracking-bill 
 
WESA: Allegheny County Executive Fitzgerald vetoes fracking ban for parks 
https://www.wesa.fm/politics-government/2022-07-14/allegheny-county-executive-fitzgerald-vetoes-
fracking-ban-for-parks  
 
KDKA: Fitzgerald wants council to rework county park fracking ban after veto 
https://www.cbsnews.com/pittsburgh/news/allegheny-county-executive-rich-fitzgerald-park-fracking-
ban-veto/ 
 
Vector Management 
 
Tribune-Review: West Nile virus found in mosquitoes in Pittsburgh, Wilkinsburg; no cases reported in 
humans  
https://triblive.com/local/west-nile-virus-found-in-mosquitoes-in-pittsburgh-cases-in-humans-reported/ 
 
KDKA Radio: Mosquitos with West Nile Virus Found in Pittsburgh Neighborhoods 
https://www.audacy.com/kdkaradio/news/local/mosquitos-with-west-nile-virus-in-pittsburgh-
neighborhoods 
 
WPXI: Allegheny County Health Department: Mosquitoes from 3 communities test positive for West Nile 
virus 
https://www.wpxi.com/news/local/allegheny-county-health-department-mosquitoes-3-communities-
test-positive-west-nile-virus/K72BFQGMI5HM7E5AM57KZ4C5Q4/ 
 
WTAE: ACHD: West Nile virus found in mosquitoes in Pittsburgh, Wilkinsburg 
https://www.wtae.com/article/west-nile-virus-pittsburgh-point-breeze-north-side-
wilkinsburg/40607406 
 
KDKA: West Nile virus found in mosquitos from 3 Allegheny County communities 



https://www.cbsnews.com/pittsburgh/news/west-nile-virus-mosquitos-3-communities-allegheny-
county/ 
 
Waste 
 
Shamokin News-Item: Kulpmont Borough dismayed at illegal dumping of garbage at yard waste pile 
https://www.newsitem.com/news/local/kulpmont-borough-council-promotes-mazzeo-to-
chief/article 66564f73-1739-5c76-9056-a15c0d08925e.html   
 
Observer-Reporter: Canonsburg taking action on delinquent trash bills  
https://observer-reporter.com/news/canonsburg-taking-action-on-delinquent-trash-
bills/article ea56c696-01e9-11ed-a54e-c39110f75214.html 
 
Water 
 
Philadelphia Inquirer: Bucks County moves ahead on $1.1 billion sewer system offer from Aqua Pa. 
https://www.inquirer.com/business/bucks-county-bcwsa-aqua-sewer-utility-sale-20220713.html 
 
Lancaster Newspapers: A new advocate rises to fight for the Conestoga River 
https://lancasteronline.com/sports/outdoors/a-new-advocate-rises-to-fight-for-the-conestoga-river-
column/article 0189938e-fee3-11ec-80f6-ab20570e99ab.html 
 
Waynesboro Record Herald: Race to help provide clean water in Kenya to take place in Waynesboro 
https://www.therecordherald.com/story/news/2022/07/14/race-to-help-provide-clean-water-in-kenya-
to-take-place-in-waynesboro/65370440007/ 
 
CBS21: New PA budget includes ARPA funds to create new Clean Streams Fund 
https://local21news.com/news/local/new-pa-budget-includes-arpa-funds-to-create-new-clean-streams-
fund 
 
Lancaster Farming: New Pennsylvania Laws Will Head Off Nutrient Runoff 
https://pagov.sharepoint.com/sites/EP-Projects/IntraDEP/SitePages/Main.aspx 
 
Huntingdon Daily News: Saxton council members request explanation from contractor 
https://www.huntingdondailynews.com/news/local/saxton-council-members-request-explanation-
from-contractor/article f735cd0d-82b9-57a7-b0cd-71c6e36ed08a.html 
 
Food and Water Watch: Bucks County Water & Sewer Authority Advances Backroom Deal with Aqua 
https://www.foodandwaterwatch.org/2022/07/13/bucks-county-water-sewer-authority-advances-
backroom-deal-with-aqua/ 
 
LevittownNow.com: Bucks County Water & Sewer Authority Exploring Plan To Sell Part Of System For 
$1.1 Billion 
https://levittownnow.com/2022/07/13/bucks-county-water-sewer-authority-exploring-plan-to-sell-
part-of-system-for-1-1-billion/ 
 
WFMZ: Bucks County Water and Sewer Authority in talks for $1B sale of sewer operations 



https://www.wfmz.com/news/area/southeastern-pa/bucks-county-water-and-sewer-authority-in-talks-
for-1-1-billion-sale-of-sewer/article 70bfb13e-02e9-11ed-bda3-e7c7f25ecbb4.html 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Ohio Valley River Fest! 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/ohio-valley-river-fest/Event?oid=22037568  
 
WBUR: As Shell prepares to open a huge plastics plant, a nurdle patrol searches the Ohio River for 
plastics 
https://www.wbur.org/hereandnow/2022/07/13/shell-plastics-nurdle-ohio 
 
Herald-Standard: Get ready to Lock and Roll 
https://www.heraldstandard.com/community life/community news/get-ready-to-lock-and-
roll/article 7ea36a54-011b-11ed-baca-c3c1f0e0b5fd.html 
 
KDKA Radio: Here's why you should never drink water from a garden hose 
https://www.audacy.com/kdkaradio/news/national/heres-why-you-should-never-drink-water-from-a-
garden-hose 
 
Miscellaneous 
 
Lancaster Newspapers: West Lampeter Township plans to prioritize sewer, roadwork costs for ARPA 
funding 
https://lancasteronline.com/news/local/west-lampeter-township-plans-to-prioritize-sewer-roadwork-
costs-for-arpa-funding/article 545722b6-02ee-11ed-b967-8783d77a348e.html 
 
Reading Eagle: Rodale Institute gets $1.1 million donation from Giant 
https://www.readingeagle.com/2022/07/14/rodale-institute-gets-1-1-million-donation-from-giant/ 
 
Central Penn Business Journal: There is more, and less, to Supreme Court EPA ruling 
https://www.cpbj.com/there-is-more-and-less-to-supreme-court-epa-ruling/ 
 
ABC27: PFBC delivers 36,000 trout to Cumberland County 
https://www.abc27.com/news/local/pfbc-delivers-36000-trout-to-cumberland-county/ 
 
Centre Daily Times: What’s the environmental cost of fast fashion? 
https://www.centredaily.com/news/environment/article263435608.html?ac cid=DM671029&ac bid=4
45069542 
 
Tribune-Review: Pittsburgh could spend $1.95 million to repair 30th Street Bridge 
https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-looks-to-hire-company-for-1-95-million-in-30th-street-bridge-
repairs/  
 
Allegheny Front: For a rural Pennsylvania area, a cryptocurrency mine brought noise pollution 
https://www.alleghenyfront.org/rural-pennsylvania-bitcoin-mine-cryptocurrency-noise-pollution/ 
  
WESA: New Pennsylvania program takes aim at a big problem — homes in need of repairs 
https://www.wesa.fm/politics-government/2022-07-14/pennsylvania-home-repair-program 


