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Mentions 
 
Beaver County Times: Attorney general, DEP secretary threaten legal action if EPA cuts emission 
standards 
http://www.timesonline.com/news/governmentandpolitics/attorney-general-dep-secretary-threaten-
legal-action-if-epa-cuts/article_21f68dd0-4d53-11e7-bc89-3b29a34decd7.html  
 
Morning Call: Gov. Tom Wolf 'treading softly' between criticizing Trump's Paris accord decision and 
supporting energy jobs 
http://www.mcall.com/news/mc-pa-trump-wolf-climate-change-20170608-story.html  
 
Air 
 
Standard Speaker: DEP: Air quality near McAdoo plant is safe 
http://standardspeaker.com/news/dep-air-quality-near-mcadoo-plant-is-safe-1.2203825  
 
Climate Change 
 
Reading Eagle: Why is the environment a partisan topic? 
http://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/ron-southwick-why-is-the-environment-a-partisan-topic 
 
Conservation & Recreation 
 
Reading Eagle: Marketing Berks County for outdoor recreation 
http://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/marketing-berks-county-for-outdoor-recreation 
 
Energy 
 
WESA: CNG Fueling Stations Grow In Pittsburgh Region, But Access Still Hard To Find 
http://wesa.fm/post/cng-fueling-stations-grow-pittsburgh-region-access-still-hard-find#stream/0 
 
Reading Eagle: U.S. must keep up with clean energy 
http://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/letter-us-must-keep-up-with-clean-energy 
 
Morning Call: Talen investigating automatic shutdown of Unit 1 at Susquehanna nuke plant 
http://www.mcall.com/business/energy/mc-talen-automatic-shut-down-susquehanna-nuclear-plant-
20170609-story.html 
 
Environmental Cleanup and Brownfields 
 
Chester County Daily Local: Residents pack East Whiteland meeting to oppose Bishop Tube plan 
http://www.dailylocal.com/article/DL/20170609/NEWS/170609825 
 
The Clarion News: Glass Works park work starts soon  
http://www.theclarionnews.com/news/frontpage/article_db9e2e69-67db-54cc-9ccf-
4412bb6e9837.html 
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Mining 
 
York Dispatch: Using miners for political gain is nothing new, but just as repulsive 
http://www.yorkdispatch.com/story/opinion/contributors/2017/06/09/oped-using-miners-political-
gain-nothing-new-but-just-repulsive/383969001/ 
 
Oil and Gas  
  
Scranton Times: Cabot hits $1 billion milestone in royalties paid 
http://thetimes-tribune.com/news/business/cabot-hits-1-billion-milestone-in-royalties-paid-1.2203611 
 
Radiation Protection 
 
York Daily Record: What's the link between Chernobyl and TMI studies? 
http://www.ydr.com/story/news/2017/06/09/tmi-and-chernobyl-link/373690001/ 
 
Carlisle Sentinel: Extension sought for storing Three Mile Island debris 
http://cumberlink.com/news/local/state-and-regional/extension-sought-for-storing-three-mile-island-
debris/article_8c65bda6-f21b-57c6-b2e1-78cdb606771e.html 
 
WITF: Extension sought for Idaho facility storing TMI debris 
http://www.witf.org/news/2017/06/-extension-sought-for-idaho-facility-storing-tmi-debris.php 
 
Pike County Courier: High levels of radon found in Pennsylvania water wells 
http://www.pikecountycourier.com/apps/pbcs.dll/article?AID=/20170609/NEWS01/170609952/0/HOM
E08/High-levels-of-radon-found-in-Pennsylvania-water-wells  
 
Vector Management 
 
WTAE: Two Lawrence County mosquito samples test positive for West Nile virus 
http://www.wtae.com/article/two-lawrence-county-mosquito-samples-test-positive-for-west-nile-
virus/10001887  
 
Waste 
  
WTAJ: Hollidaysburg Borough Council votes against single-trash-hauler 
http://www.wearecentralpa.com/news/hollidaysburg-borough-council-votes-against-single-trash-
hauler/736858363 
 
The Derrick: OC to host 2 recycling programs for electronics, tires in August  
http://www.thederrick.com/news/community_news/oc-to-host-recycling-programs-for-electronics-
tires-in-august/article_ab025150-9ae5-50b1-a893-2ca5ee59c530.html 
 
Morning Call: Two more towns oppose Slate Belt sludge-drying project 
http://www.mcall.com/business/energy/mc-synagro-sludge-plant-meeting-june-12-20170608-
story.html 
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Water 
 
Bucks County Courier Times: Congressmen press defense officials on firefighting foams following Friday 
Unwell Water story 
http://www.buckscountycouriertimes.com/news/horsham-pfos/congressmen-press-defense-officials-
on-firefighting-foams-following-friday-unwell/article_f15e8b1b-38e6-5a78-9b0c-baf28a880d57.html 
 
Bucks County Courier Times: Dangers of firefighting foam discussed in 2001, document shows 
http://www.buckscountycouriertimes.com/news/horsham-pfos/dangers-of-firefighting-foam-discussed-
in-document-shows/article_fcded1ff-e610-583a-9b15-ba1c84740b55.html 
 
Chester County Daily Local: Dinniman calls for Public Hearing on Pennsylvania American water company 
rate hike 
http://www.dailylocal.com/general-news/20170611/dinniman-calls-for-public-hearing-on-pennsylvania-
american-water-company-rate-hike 
 
Chester County Daily Local: Water towers demolition symbolizes end of Pennhurst segregation 
http://www.dailylocal.com/general-news/20170611/water-towers-demolition-symbolizes-end-of-
pennhurst-segregation 
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette:  Grafius Run relief may be coming 
http://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2017/06/grafius-run-relief-may-be-coming/ 
 
Reading Eagle: Number cited for trespassing at The Rock tops 100 
http://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/number-cited-for-trespassing-at-the-rock-tops-100 
 
Lancaster Newspapers: Governors of Chesapeake Bay cleanup states, including Pennsylvania, push for 
continued funding 
http://lancasteronline.com/news/pennsylvania/governors-of-chesapeake-bay-cleanup-states-including-
pennsylvania-push-for/article_fc2fd964-4d1e-11e7-bbe3-0f70ff9688e3.html 
 
Lancaster Newspapers: 'Better safe than sorry': Officials turn off Columbia bridge lights before mayfly 
swarms return 
http://lancasteronline.com/news/local/better-safe-than-sorry-officials-turn-off-columbia-bridge-
lights/article_302ddf48-4e0c-11e7-9b3f-cf8ef8097b2a.html 
 
York Dispatch: Lights out at Veterans Memorial Bridge to combat mayflies 
http://www.yorkdispatch.com/story/news/2017/06/11/lights-out-veterans-memorial-bridge-combat-
mayflies/102761434/ 
 
Carlisle Sentinel: South Middleton Township buys Bubble property for $1 
http://cumberlink.com/news/local/communities/boiling_springs/south-middleton-township-buys-
bubble-property-for/article_a3e9cfc8-b9e9-5630-91bc-d32fbbdf0997.html 
 
abc27: Veterans Memorial Bridge lights to be turned off due to Mayflies 
http://abc27.com/2017/06/10/veterans-memorial-bridge-lights-to-be-turned-off-due-to-mayflies/ 
 
CBS21: Lights on Veterans Memorial Bridge will be turned off due to Mayflies 
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http://local21news.com/news/local/lights-on-veterans-memorial-bridge-to-be-turned-off-to-prevent-
mayflys 
 
Meadville Tribune: Public weighs in as Meadville water fluoridation vote looms  
http://www.meadvilletribune.com/news/public-weighs-in-as-meadville-water-fluoridation-vote-
looms/article_179f5c30-4d81-11e7-a096-83b098d8321a.html 
 
Tribune Review: In a first, Pittsburgh will seek approval to replace privately owned lead water lines 
http://triblive.com/local/allegheny/12389669-74/in-a-first-pittsburgh-will-seek-approval-to-replace-
privately-owned-lead 
 
WPXI: Pittsburgh begins distributing filters as part of Safe Water Program 
http://www.wpxi.com/news/top-stories/city-begins-distributing-filters-as-part-of-safe-water-program-
1/521280925  
 
Observer Reporter: COMMENTARY Marianna dam should be saved 
http://www.observer-reporter.com/20170610/commentary_marianna_dam_should_be_saved  
 
Republican Herald: Appeal sustained for Hegins Twp. residents over sewer plan 
http://republicanherald.com/news/appeal-sustained-for-hegins-twp-residents-over-sewer-plan-
1.2203421 
 
Tri-Boro Banner: STUDYING THE WATERSHED 
http://www.triborobanner.com/news/school/studying-the-watershed-1.2203067 
 
Miscellaneous 
 
Reading Eagle: GOP getting it wrong on environment issue 
http://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/letter-gop-getting-it-wrong-on-environment-issue 
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