
Some clips may be behind a paywall.  If you need access to these clips, email me at djagiela@pa.gov.   
 
Top DEP Stories 
 
Times Leader: Wyoming Valley Sanitary Authority releases stormwater pollution reduction plan 
https://www.timesleader.com/news/754606/wyoming-valley-sanitary-authority-releases-stormwater-
pollution-reduction-plan 
 
Towanda Daily Review: DEP issues Sunoco $319,000 in penalties for Mariner East 2 Pipeline construction 
violations 
https://www.thedailyreview.com/news/local/dep-issues-sunoco-in-penalties-for-mariner-east-pipeline-
construction/article_0e22bd2c-c50a-57fd-835b-41918a1234d0.html 
 
Mentions 
 
Citizens’ Voice: Ice Lakes dam issue in Rice Twp. grinds on 
https://www.citizensvoice.com/arts-living/ice-lakes-dam-issue-in-rice-twp-grinds-on-1.2526871 
 
Beaver County Times: Council of Government wants input on Conservation District board 
https://www.timesonline.com/news/20190903/council-of-government-wants-input-on-conservation-
district-board 
 
Tribune-Democrat: WATCH VIDEO | DEP chief: Sewer work a challenge for residents, important for 
water quality 
https://www.tribdem.com/news/watch-video-dep-chief-sewer-work-a-challenge-for-
residents/article_6bf2a996-cd35-11e9-8430-47e119743eaf.html 
 
DESMOG blog: Pipeline Permit Scandal Highlights Confusion Amid Push to Build Plastics Plants 
https://www.desmogblog.com/2019/08/30/shell-beaver-county-pennsylvania-revolution-pipeline-
permit-scandal 
 
Air 
 
WPXI: What's that smell in Allegheny County? Turns out, there's an explanation 
https://www.wpxi.com/news/top-stories/what-s-that-smell-in-allegheny-county-turns-out-there-s-an-
explanation/982415380 
 
Climate Change 
 
Centre Daily Times: Are you serious about reducing your carbon footprint?  Look to transportation 
(Centre Climate column) 
https://www.centredaily.com/living/liv-columns-blogs/article234493837.html 
 
Conservation & Recreation 
 
Erie Times: Presque Isle extends swimming season, pontoon tours 
https://www.goerie.com/news/20190903/presque-isle-extends-swimming-season-pontoon-tours 
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WICU-TV: Swimming Season, Pontoon Boat Rides Extended at Presque Isle State Park 
https://www.erienewsnow.com/story/40996973/swimming-season-pontoon-boat-rides-extended-at-
presque-isle-state-park 
 
Williamsport Sun-Gazette: Proposed addition to Riverwalk extension serves Newberry 
http://www.sungazette.com/news/top-news/2019/09/proposed-addition-to-riverwalk-extension-
serves-newberry/ 
 
Penn State News: Deer browsing is not stopping the densification of Eastern forests 
https://news.psu.edu/story/585959/2019/09/03/research/deer-browsing-not-stopping-densification-
eastern-forests 
 
Pennlive: Massive acreage added to Pennsylvania’s newest national wildlife refuge 
https://www.pennlive.com/life/2019/09/massive-acreage-added-to-pennsylvanias-newest-national-
wildlife-refuge.html 
 
York Daily Record: Four Pa. outdoors phenomena to watch for in fall  
https://www.ydr.com/story/news/2019/09/03/four-fall-things-watch-outdoors-pa-column-deer-elk-
geese-dove-hunting-leaves-changing-autumn/2196514001/ 
 
WJAC: Sensory garden helps residents in Cambria County 
https://wjactv.com/news/local/sensory-garden-helps-residents-in-cambria-county  
 
Tribune-Review: Pittsburgh’s I-579 ‘cap’ will cause traffic disruptions 
https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-allegheny/pittsburghs-i-579-cap-will-cause-traffic-disruptions/ 
 
Morning Call: Cherry Valley Wildlife Refuge celebrates protection of 4,350 acres for wildlife, recreation 
https://www.mcall.com/news/local/nazareth/mc-nws-cherry-valley-wildlife-refuge-dedication-
20190904-6crfhiebavgbtkzrb7gqgu53aa-story.html 
 
Morning Call: Saucon Rail Trail helped Lehigh Valley businesses; they want to return the favor, give 
people more walking trails, green spaces 
https://www.mcall.com/business/mc-biz-lehigh-valley-green-retail-program-20190903-
gnp6nxef2bgsnhax7qm46uz2pm-story.html 
 
Energy 
 
Times News: Schuylkill officials consider zoning amendment relating to wind turbines  
https://www.tnonline.com/schuylkill-officials-consider-zoning-amendment-relating-wind-turbines 
 
Reading Eagle: Power play: Blue Marsh Dam again eyed for electric production 
https://www.readingeagle.com/news/article/power-play-blue-marsh-dam-again-eyed-for-electric-
production 
 
Pennlive: Going green? Good luck!  
https://wwwpennlive.com/opinion/2019/09/going-green-good-luck-pennlive-letters.html 
 
Pennlive: Will Hurricane Dorian make gas prices go higher in central Pa.? 
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https://www.pennlive.com/life/2019/09/will-hurricane-dorian-make-gas-prices-go-higher-in-central-
pa.html 
 
ABC27: Fear of industry replacing Three Mile Island’s absence 
https://www.abc27.com/news/pennsylvania/fear-of-industry-replacing-three-mile-islands-absence/ 
 
KDKA: Mayor Peduto Requires New City Buildings To Be Net-Zero, Energy Efficient 
https://pittsburgh.cbslocal.com/2019/09/03/mayor-peduto-requires-new-city-buildings-to-be-net-zero-
energy-efficient/  
 
WESA: City Proposes More Efficient And Sustainable Buildings To Reduce Energy Use By 2030 
https://www.wesa.fm/post/city-proposes-more-efficient-and-sustainable-buildings-reduce-energy-use-
2030 
 
Pittsburgh Business Times: Peduto wants city buildings to produce as much energy as they use 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2019/09/03/peduto-wants-city-buildings-to-produce-as-
much.html 
 
Post-Gazette: Net-zero hour: Pittsburgh energizes plan to curb carbon emissions from public buildings 
https://www.post-gazette.com/local/city/2019/09/03/pittsburgh-energy-efficiency-net-zero-buildings-
greenhouse-gas-emissions-mayor-bill-peduto/stories/201909030087 
 
Tribune-Review: Pittsburgh moving to reduce energy consumption by 50% 
https://triblive.com/local/pittsburgh-allegheny/pittsburgh-moving-to-reduce-energy-consumption-by-
50-percent/ 
 
Pittsburgh City Paper: Mayor Bill Peduto introduces bill to eliminate carbon emissions produced by local 
government buildings 
https://www.pghcitypaper.com/pittsburgh/mayor-bill-peduto-introduces-bill-to-eliminate-carbon-
emissions-produced-by-local-government-buildings/Content?oid=15769349 
 
Environmental Cleanup & Brownfields 
 
Times Observer: Allegheny/Kinzua cleanup efforts aided by scrap metal donations 
http://www.timesobserver.com/news/local-news/2019/09/allegheny-kinzua-cleanup-efforts-aided-by-
scrap-metal-donations/ 
 
Times Observer: Chapman seeks volunteers for National Public Lands Day 
http://www.timesobserver.com/news/local-news/2019/09/chapman-seeks-volunteers-for-national-
public-lands-day/ 
 
Oil and Gas  
 
Bradford Era: Gas prices dip in Western Pennsylvania   
http://www.bradfordera.com/news/business/gas-prices-dip-in-western-pennsylvania/article_1c018dc1-
708f-5306-8740-341d40344517.html 
 
Kittanning Paper: Fire Department to Benefit from Gas Well Impact Money 
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http://www.kittanningpaper.com/2019/09/03/fire-department-to-benefit-from-gas-well-impact-
money/78622 
 
Tribune-Review: Analyst: Hurricane Dorian not expected to impact gas prices 
https://triblive.com/local/regional/analyst-hurricane-dorian-not-expected-to-impact-gas-prices/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Murrysville will continue fracking well hearing on Wednesday 
https://triblive.com/local/murrysville/murrysville-will-continue-fracking-well-hearing-on-wednesday/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Car catches fire near kerosene tank at Sheetz in Plum; no one injured 
https://triblive.com/local/valley-news-dispatch/car-catches-fire-near-kerosene-tank-at-sheetz-gas-
station-in-plum-no-one-injured/ 
 
Star Beacon: Risberg pipeline targets mid-fall for completion date 
https://www.starbeacon.com/news/local_news/risberg-pipeline-targets-mid-fall-for-completion-
date/article_378a8085-4e30-5966-845c-5f05287d1b6e.html 
 
Radiation Protection 
 
Sayre Morning Times: Japan briefs diplomats on Fukushima nuclear water concerns 
http://www.morning-times.com/business/article_bd8a0740-ebd9-5c62-a770-4bb5f1b3596f.html 
 
Vector Management 
 
Towanda Daily Review: Agriculture Department invites PA students to help fight spotted lanternfly 
https://www.thedailyreview.com/news/local/agriculture-department-invites-pennsylvania-students-to-
help-fight-spotted-lanternfly/article_b3698a26-522b-5fa5-9cb2-7caddba17f21.html 
 
Waste 
 
Daily American: County eyes changes to recycling program 
https://www.dailyamerican.com/news/local/somerset/family/county-eyes-changes-to-recycling-
program/article_e9541f11-5511-517d-ae1e-c0c8b63e6bd6.html 
 
Water 
 
News Eagle: Is climate change turning our Big Lake green? 
https://www.neagle.com/news/20190830/is-climate-change-turning-our-big-lake-green 
 
Ridgway Record: New retaining wall to protect the Armory from Gallagher Run (pg 1) 
https://www.ridgwayrecord.com/sites/default/files/RR-9-4-19.pdf 
 
Sunbury Daily Item: Danville borrows, reallocates levee raising funds 
https://www.dailyitem.com/the_danville_news/danville-borrows-reallocates-levee-raising-
funds/article_7108989f-2274-5bfd-ba33-c87eb988a102.html 
 
Bloomsburg Press-Enterprise: Levee project hits $1M hurdle; Danville council OKs line of credit for flood-
protection plan 
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https://www.pressenterpriseonline.com/daily/090419/page/1/story/levee-project-hits-1m-hurdle 
 
WPXI: Water main break in Center Twp 
https://www.wpxi.com/video?videoId=982456511&videoVersion=1.0 
 
Tribune-Review: Oakmont Commons to be surveyed to determine flooding solutions 
https://triblive.com/local/plum/oakmont-commons-to-be-surveyed-to-determine-flooding-solutions/ 
 
Tribune-Review: State officials pledge more ‘aggressive’ approach to combating overgrowth at Somerset 
County lake 
https://triblive.com/local/regional/state-officials-pledge-more-aggressive-approach-to-combating-
overgrowth-at-somerset-county-lake/ 
 
Tribune-Review: Moon eyes fee to help pay for storm water management 
https://www.post-gazette.com/local/west/2019/09/03/Moon-eyes-fee-to-help-pay-for-storm-water-
management/stories/201909050005 
 
Miscellaneous 
 
Meadville Times: As butterflies vanish, researchers investigate road salt as culprit — and cure (pg 1) 
https://meadvilletribune-cnhi.newsmemory.com/ 
 
Lock Haven Express: Turkey vultures inflict thousands in damage to county’s Willowbank Building 
http://www.lockhaven.com/news/local-news/2019/09/turkey-vultures-inflict-thousands-in-damage-to-
willowbank/ 
 
Centre Daily Times: Birds are costing Centre County thousands of dollars in damage 
https://www.centredaily.com/news/local/article234661497.html 
 
Altoona Mirror: Fall offers time to prep pastures 
http://www.altoonamirror.com/news/local-news/2019/09/fall-offers-time-to-prep-pastures/ 
 
Huntingdon Daily News: Parking spaces, tank, part of forestry project 
https://www.huntingdondailynews.com/news/local/parking-spaces-tank-part-of-forestry-
project/article_0a50f296-3c61-5a39-aa13-78bffaf68e5e.html 
 
WGAL: Officials: PennDOT crew that caused gas leak didn't check on underground lines before starting 
work 
https://www.wgal.com/article/officials-crew-that-hit-gas-main-in-east-lampeter-township-didn-t-check-
on-underground-lines-before-starting-work/28901380 
 
WJAC: Bellefonte officials approve 'vulture defense system' for county building 
https://wjactv.com/news/local/bellefonte-officials-approve-vulture-defense-system-for-county-building 
 
Observer-Reporter: PUC approves settlement for Centerville crossing 
https://observer-reporter.com/news/localnews/puc-approves-settlement-for-centerville-
crossing/article_8d64b6be-ce52-11e9-86c6-f7af2476a393.html 
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https://wjactv.com/news/local/bellefonte-officials-approve-vulture-defense-system-for-county-building
https://observer-reporter.com/news/localnews/puc-approves-settlement-for-centerville-crossing/article_8d64b6be-ce52-11e9-86c6-f7af2476a393.html
https://observer-reporter.com/news/localnews/puc-approves-settlement-for-centerville-crossing/article_8d64b6be-ce52-11e9-86c6-f7af2476a393.html


Pittsburgh Business Times: Michael Baker International receives contract to provide services in 50 states 
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2019/09/04/michael-baker-international-receives-
contract-to.html?iana=hpmvp_pit_news_headline 
 
Tribune-Review: New Stanton ramp repair will detour traffic at I-70/Route 119 interchange 
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/new-stanton-ramp-repair-will-detour-traffic-at-i-70-route-119-
interchange/ 

https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2019/09/04/michael-baker-international-receives-contract-to.html?iana=hpmvp_pit_news_headline
https://www.bizjournals.com/pittsburgh/news/2019/09/04/michael-baker-international-receives-contract-to.html?iana=hpmvp_pit_news_headline
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/new-stanton-ramp-repair-will-detour-traffic-at-i-70-route-119-interchange/
https://triblive.com/local/westmoreland/new-stanton-ramp-repair-will-detour-traffic-at-i-70-route-119-interchange/

